
Eric Bell 

I’ve been an official for over 14 years.  I started as a 
recreational/intramural official in Germany officiating basketball, 
football, and softball in 2003.  It wasn’t until I returned to the 
states in 2012 in Georgia, where I decided to take the officiating 
business as more than just a hobby.  I’ve also officiated in Korea, 
Washington, Hawaii, and now Las Vegas.  I am a detail-oriented 
official, well-versed in high level gameplay, 
rules and Regulations. Able to monitor players and work with 
officiating team. to resolve issues quickly and preserve the 
highest standards. High-energy, outstanding physical fitness, 
versatile and complex problem-solver capable of working with and 
leading all levels officiating. 
 
Outside of officiating, who am I you may ask. I am a leader 
among leaders.  I am a recently retired Army veteran who served 
over 28 years.  I exited my military career as a Regional Senior-
level Logistics Manager. My military experience allows me to bring 
rock-solid leadership and to provide skills in organizational 
management, executive level oral and written communication, 
work management, budget and resource management, office 
administration management, and analytical reasoning.  I’m the 
ultimate problem solver with decision making skills that will assist 
this organization with success.  I have always lived with the 
values of loyalty, respect, selfless service, integrity, honor, and 
honesty. I have supervised and led a diverse group of 
over 800 people in one organization. I have served as an Equal 
Opportunity Adviser, Diversity and Inclusion Officer, several 
position leading an organization applying ingenuity, attention to 
detail, and upholding standards. 
 
I am not a familiar face to most of you.  Why do I deserve to serve 
you as a member of this board.  I bring a new set of eyes that can 
see what is needed, CHANGE.  If I can lead Soldiers through the 
stress and battles of war, I can surely fight for you.  I’ve always 



been a person recognized for my ability to mentor, motivate, and 
influence others.  I serve as HOA board member, National 
President of another organization, and currently direct other 
managers in the supply chain field.  I AM HIM! 
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